
The World of Robert Jordan's The Wheel of
Time
The Wheel of Time is a fantasy series by Robert Jordan that has captured
the imagination of readers around the world. With over 14 million copies
sold, the series has been translated into over 30 languages and has
spawned a popular television adaptation. The Wheel of Time is set in a rich
and detailed world that is full of history, geography, magic, and characters.
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History

The history of the Wheel of Time is long and complex. The series is set in
the Third Age, which began after the Breaking of the World. The Breaking
was a cataclysmic event that occurred when the Dark One, an evil entity,
was imprisoned. The Breaking shattered the world and caused widespread
destruction. The Third Age is a time of rebuilding and recovery, but the Dark
One still threatens to break free and destroy the world again.
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Geography

The Wheel of Time is set on a continent called Randland. Randland is
divided into four major regions: the Westlands, the Aiel Waste, the
Seanchan Empire, and the Land of the Shadow. The Westlands are home
to the human nations of Andor, Cairhien, Tear, and Illian. The Aiel Waste is
a vast desert inhabited by the nomadic Aiel people. The Seanchan Empire
is a powerful nation located to the south of the Westlands. The Land of the
Shadow is a dark and dangerous place where the Dark One resides.

Magic

Magic is a powerful force in the Wheel of Time. It is wielded by the Aes
Sedai, a group of women who are trained to channel the One Power. The
One Power is a form of energy that can be used to create, destroy, and
heal. The Aes Sedai are divided into seven Ajahs, each of which has its
own focus and purpose. The Red Ajah, for example, is known for its focus
on hunting and killing Darkfriends, while the White Ajah is known for its
focus on healing.

Characters

The Wheel of Time features a large and diverse cast of characters. The
main characters are Rand al'Thor, a young man who is destined to be the
Dragon Reborn, and Egwene al'Vere, a young woman who is destined to
be the Amyrlin Seat, the leader of the Aes Sedai. Other important
characters include Perrin Aybara, a blacksmith who is destined to be the
Lord of the Two Rivers, and Mat Cauthon, a gambler and thief who is
destined to be the General of the Light. The characters in the Wheel of
Time are complex and well-developed, and they play a vital role in the
story.



The Wheel of Time is a masterpiece of fantasy literature. It is a series that
is full of rich and detailed worldbuilding, compelling characters, and exciting
action. If you are a fan of fantasy, then you owe it to yourself to read the
Wheel of Time. You will not be disappointed.
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